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'What if truth is a woman?' is how the German philosopher Friedrich Nietzsche chose to pose a very
important question of philosophy. Indiabulls, group of developers who have promised a plethora of
realty projects across India, have chosen a similar analogy to present one of their forthcoming
luxurious residential project in Gurgaon, namely Indiabulls Enigma. However, the reasons why this
project is quite suitable to urban needs is no mystery. In this respect, the name seems to be quite a
misnomer. For one, Indiabulls Enigma has an edge over several other upcoming residential projects
due to the kind of location advantage it promises.

Indiabulls Enigma spreads over 15.6 acres of land in Sector 110 in Gurgaon. Located close to the
Indira Gandhi International Airport, Indiabulls Enigma, will be next to proposed IT parks and office
spaces. It will connect well to Dwarka, Palam Vihar, and NH-8 via the upcoming Dwarka-Manesar
Expressway.  Considering that traffic woes have reached such intolerable levels that people would
rather change locations than spend quality hours honking at other cars or listening to car radio,
Indiabulls Enigma comes as a soothing relief, for many professionals (soon to be residents of
Indiabulls Enigma) will realize that their travel time from home to office is bound to reduce
considering the availability of these routes to and fro Sector 110, Gurgaon. Due to the emergence of
a number of high end residential projects, this area is bound to be an upscale locality, an address
which will make friends and colleagues jealous.

The project offers seven varieties of flats of varying sizes with sizes ranging from 3340 sq. ft to 7500
sq. ft. These include three types of 4 BHK flats and four types of 5BHK flats including two kinds of
designs for penthouses. There will be no structure to prohibit a scenic view of green landscapes or
rays of sunlight in the morning. It won't come as a surprise if film makers decide to shoot scenic
shots for their movies in acres of undiluted greens with dense shade giving trees, water bodies and
meeting spots of Indiabulls Enigma instead of a location like Lonavala or Khandala near Mumbai.
Outdoors will also include jogging tracks, walking trails, tennis courts and kid's play area. A
clubhouse with centers for recreational activities such as a swimming pool, gymnasium, relaxation
pool, spa, aerobic studio, yoga center, barbeque stations with counters.

The flats will be equipped with energy efficient VRV centrally air-conditioning, marble interiors,
complete electric power backup and advanced security features including close circuited television
cameras at common areas such as lobby entrances and at the main gate, sensor boards and
automated barriers.

Considering the kind of lifestyle and facilities Indiabulls Enigma offers, it won't be puzzling to know
that currently most of the apartments are available on resale. Some are available directly from the
developer. The fact that Indiabulls Enigma will make a good realty investment is no mystery.
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Anil yadav is real estate consultant who experts in all the hot projects in Gurgaon and he has deep
interest in writing articles.he also given his views to Indiabulls Enigma  . The price of Indiabulls
Enigma Gurgaon is very affordable. 

For more information you can visit on our website @ 

http://www.indiabullsenigma.net/
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